
Advisory for Indians living in Denmark

Indian nationals living in Denmark are requested and strongly advised to
consider  giving  priority  to  their  registration  with  the  Embassy  through  the
official website portal with all necessary information, which comes useful in
rendering prompt assistance to Indian nationals in distress or in extraordinary
circumstances, besides timely redressal of grievances. Such information is also
useful  for  sharing  important  announcements  or  extending  invitations  for
National Day celebrations and similar social/ celebratory occasions.

The External  Affairs  Ministry  has  launched the  Global  Pravasi  Rishta
portal and app to connect with the over 30 million strong Indian diaspora across
the world. It aims to create a three-way communication between the Ministry,
Indian  Missions  and  the  diaspora.  This  portal  is  created  to  enable  the
registration of Indian diaspora members, i.e. NRIs, PIOs and the OCIs which
will  not  only  facilitate  the  Indian  government  to  connect  with  the  overseas
Indian  community  but  also  facilitate  NRIs,  OCIs  and  PIOs  community  by
connecting them to various new and existing government schemes benefiting
them in various areas of interest. The Embassy of India requests Indian diaspora
to register themselves on the link https://pravasirishta.gov.in.

The  Embassy  of  India  Indian  students  to  register  themselves  on  the
MADAD  portal  (https://madad.gov.in/)  with  their  full  details  like  passport,
course,  university/institution,  address,  email  ids.  This  portal  will  also  assist
during any crisis management and lend a helping hand to the students. It will
also enable the students to reach the consular officers and services in time of
emergencies.

For any clarification or technical assistance in this regard, queries may
please  be  addressed  to  Mr.  Neeraj,  Assistant  Consular  Officer  at
cons.copenhagen@mea.gov.in.
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